
Time: 1:00 PM 

Advanced Site Contractors 
Inc. 

A. Russo Wrecking Inc.
Gateway Demolition 

Corp.
Gramercy Group Inc. NorthStar Contracting Group SCE Environmental Group The LandTek Group Inc Unitech Servicing Group

United Industries and 
Construction Corp.

Watral Brothers Inc.

EF-097-AQ 3270 Parkway Dr, Baldwin, NY 11510 N/A $17,550.00 N/A $36,900.00 $59,637.00 $36,936.20 $63,325.00 $37,195.00 $79,840.00 
EF-299-AQ 224 Hudson Ave, Freeport, NY 11520 N/A $39,500.00 N/A $2,300.00 $8,771.00 $4,445.44 $6,850.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 

Total Batch 1 Address No Bid $57,050.00 No Bid $39,200.00 $68,408.00 $41,381.64* $70,175.00 - $37,295.00 $84,840.00

EF-165-AQ
997 Pacific St, Lindenhurst, NY 11757

Provide
N/A $66,950.00 N/A $42,900.00 $65,200.00 $34,200.00 $94,290.00 $79,460.00 

LH-050 877 S Bay St, Lindenhurst, NY 11757 N/A $40,250.00 N/A $23,700.00 $36,800.00 $36,600.00 $34,265.00 $69,920.00 

LH-128 854 Atlantic St, Lindenhurst, NY 11757 N/A $27,975.00 N/A $24,300.00 $43,250.00 $34,600.00 $35,795.00 $89,700.00 

LH-133 836 Atlantic St, Lindenhurst, NY 11757 N/A $39,575.00 N/A $31,800.00 $58,125.00 $41,200.00 $35,795.00 $98,500.00 
LH-051 885 S Bay St, Lindenhurst, NY 11757 N/A $41,875.00 N/A $28,600.00 $88,210.00 $40,000.00 $35,795.00 $49,990.00 

EF-086-AQ 18 W Harrison Ave, Babylon, NY 11702 N/A $26,785.00 N/A $22,100.00 $45,175.00 $20,000.00 $34,265.00 $64,690.00 
EF-291-AQ 590 Fire Island Ave, Babylon, NY 11702 N/A $42,785.00 N/A $38,200.00 $54,565.00 $28,000.00 $39,620.00 $64,860.00 
EF-088-AQ 137 Sequams Ln W, West Islip, NY 11795 N/A $40,975.00 N/A $45,100.00 $44,900.00 $24,200.00 $39,620.00 $64,400.00 
EF-089-AQ 139 Sequams Ln E, West Islip, NY 11795 N/A $28,685.00 N/A $27,500.00 $43,850.00 $24,800.00 $39,620.00 $74,880.00 
EF-091-AQ 121 Sequams Ln W, West Islip, NY 11795 N/A $47,975.00 N/A $41,400.00 $47,975.00 $26,600.00 $43,445.00 $74,940.00 

Total Batch 2 Address No Bid $403,830.00 No Bid $325,600.00 - - $528,050.00* $310,200.00 $432,510.00 $731,340.00

OAK-013 567 Shore Dr, Oakdale, NY 11769 N/A $53,575.00 N/A $46,900.00 $89,010.00 $57,270.00 $74,925.00 $26,200.00 $72,545.00 $89,870.00 
SV-012 46 Terry St, Sayville, NY 11782 N/A $56,750.00 N/A $73,400.00 $94,208.00 $70,878.96 $70,550.00 $48,000.00 $52,745.00 $94,200.00 
SV-014 50 Terry St, Sayville, NY 11782 N/A $45,475.00 N/A $30,600.00 $77,055.00 $46,344.04 $69,200.00 $44,000.00 $34,720.00 $84,780.00 
SV-015 56 Terry St, Sayville, NY 11782 N/A $37,450.00 N/A $27,400.00 $73,004.00 $42,871.31 $61,250.00 $38,200.00 $34,720.00 $79,850.00 
VP-035 14 Dewitt Ave, Patchogue, NY 11772 N/A $29,375.00 N/A $24,500.00 $67,271.00 $46,371.96 $38,175.00 $26,200.00 $33,465.00 $64,800.00 

Total Batch 3 Address No Bid $222,625.00 No Bid $202,800.00 $400,548.00* $263,736.27* $314,100.00 $182,600.00 $228,195.00 $413,500.00

EF-144-AQ 65 Culross Dr, Rocky Point, NY 11778 N/A $69,785.00 N/A $64,500.00 $135,350.00 $74,600.00 N/A $109,640.00 
FL-034 154 Temple Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $31,875.00 N/A $24,900.00 $43,275.00 $26,400.00 N/A $54,980.00 
FL-052 287 Royal Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $41,875.00 N/A $29,800.00 $44,785.00 $22,000.00 N/A $59,920.00 
FL-062 298 Royal Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $30,275.00 N/A $16,300.00 $47,100.00 $20,000.00 N/A $54,870.00 
FL-079 26 Pine Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $25,585.00 N/A $21,800.00 $39,200.00 $16,000.00 N/A $49,970.00 
FL-104 27 Pine Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $25,585.00 N/A $25,300.00 $39,150.00 $20,000.00 N/A $49,980.00 
FL-105 31 Pine Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 N/A $29,275.00 N/A $34,300.00 $39,800.00 $20,000.00 N/A $49,840.00 

ER-031-AQ 330 Sound Beach Boulevard, Sound Beach N/A $57,585.00 N/A $36,200.00 $140,200.00 $72,000.00 N/A $64,830.00 
ER-051 17 Shore Drive, Sound Beach NY N/A $67,575.00 N/A $51,600.00 $138,500.00 $66,000.00 N/A $94,930.00 

Total Batch 4 Address No Bid $379,415.00 No Bid $304,700.00 - - $667,360.00 $337,000.00 No Bid $588,960.00*

OBBO-037 66 Foxbeach Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $55,000.00 $39,575.00 $6,900.00 $54,700.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-409 74 Foxbeach Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $49,500.00 $38,695.00 $52,300.00 $74,800.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-122 83 Foxbeach Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $49,500.00 $21,985.00 $56,800.00 $28,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-058 107 Foxbeach Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $12,000.00 $11,975.00 $1,500.00 $2,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-136 109, 111 and 113 Foxbeach Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $105,000.00 $76,575.00 $130,200.00 $68,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-002 133 Fox beach Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $98,000.00 $63,500.00 $75,500.00 $94,400.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-009a 137 Fox Beach Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $47,500.00 $32,285.00 $31,200.00 $36,800.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-041 153 Foxbeach Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $49,500.00 $35,250.00 $27,900.00 $31,100.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-081a 175 Foxbeach Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $18,000.00 $11,975.00 $1,500.00 $2,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-035 100 Fox Ln, Staten Island, NY 10306 $50,000.00 $30,350.00 $40,700.00 $28,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-025a 106 Fox Ln, Staten Island, NY 10306 $58,500.00 $38,475.00 $38,200.00 $57,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-432a 112 Fox Ln, Staten Island, NY 10306 $55,000.00 $38,850.00 $42,600.00 $2,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-064 221 Fox Ln, Staten Island, NY 10306 $56,000.00 $33,785.00 $43,768.00 $57,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-049 24 Kissam Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $50,000.00 $34,350.00 $19,900.00 $28,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-026a 51 Kissam Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $50,000.00 $33,785.00 $39,500.00 $44,200.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-011 69 Kissam Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $47,500.00 $28,450.00 $33,300.00 $68,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-082a 108 Kissam Ave , Staten Island, NY 10306 $18,000.00 $11,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-039 460 Mill Rd, Staten Island, NY 10306 $125,000.00 $39,750.00 $101,000.00 $39,800.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-084 42 Tarlton St, Staten Island, NY 10306 $49,500.00 $35,475.00 $36,400.00 $57,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-060 45 Tarlton St, Staten Island, NY 10306 $56,500.00 $39,775.00 $48,300.00 $74,800.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-135 71 Tarlton Street , Staten Island, NY 10306 $49,500.00 $34,950.00 $58,000.00 $28,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-046 91 Tarlton St, Staten Island, NY 10306 $68,000.00 $39,575.00 $77,700.00 $63,900.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-055 117 Tarlton St, Staten Island, NY 10306 $60,000.00 $39,585.00 $6,900.00 $54,700.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-114 641 Cedar Grove Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $58,000.00 $43,625.00 $60,000.00 $54,700.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-160 645 Cedar Grove Ave, Staten Island, NY 10306 $55,000.00 $39,575.00 $60,100.00 $54,700.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

OBBO-320 151 Dugdale St, Staten Island, NY 10306 $115,000.00 $73,875.00 $95,400.00 $98,400.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

Total Batch 5 Address $1,505,500.00 $967,545.00 $1,187,068.00 $1,212,700.00 - - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch

Vendors 

Vendor did not bid on all items in this 
batch

* Total batch price called at the bid opening corrected to reflect accurate computation.

Governor's Office of Storm Recovery 
Bid Tabulation Sheet 

Invitation for Bid: Demolition of Residential Properties Bid Opening: September 15, 2014

NOTE: Bid tabulations are provided for informational purposes only. Contracts are awarded, if at all, to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder. 
An apparent low bid is therefore not the sole basis for contract award and should not be construed as such.

Vendor did not bid on all items in this 
batch

Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch

Vendor did not bid on all items in this 
batch

Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch

Vendor did not bid on all items in this 
batch



Vendor Total Batch Price Vendor Total Batch Price
United Industries and Construction Corp. $37,295.00 Unitech Servicing Group $310,200.00
Gramercy Group Inc. $39,200.00 Gramercy Group Inc. $325,600.00
SCE Environmental Group $41,381.64 A. Russo Wrecking Inc. $403,830.00
A. Russo Wrecking Inc. $57,050.00 United Industries and Construction Corp. $432,510.00
NorthStar Contracting Group $68,408.00 The LandTek Group $528,050.00
The LandTek Group $70,175.00 Watral Brothers Inc. $731,340.00
Watral Brothers Inc. $84,840.00 NorthStar Contracting Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

Unitech Servicing Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch SCE Environmental Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

Advanced Site Contractors Inc. No Bid Advanced Site Contractors Inc. No Bid

Gateway Demolition Corp. No Bid Gateway Demolition Corp. No Bid

Vendor Total Batch Price Vendor Total Batch Price
Unitech Servicing Group $182,600.00 Gramercy Group Inc. $304,700.00
Gramercy Group Inc. $202,800.00 Unitech Servicing Group $337,000.00
A. Russo Wrecking Inc. $222,625.00 A. Russo Wrecking Inc. $379,415.00
United Industries and Construction Corp. $228,195.00 Watral Brothers Inc. $588,960.00
SCE Environmental Group $263,736.27 The LandTek Group $667,360.00
The LandTek Group $314,100.00 NorthStar Contracting Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

NorthStar Contracting Group $400,548.00 SCE Environmental Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

Watral Brothers Inc. $413,500.00 Advanced Site Contractors Inc. No Bid

Advanced Site Contractors Inc. No Bid Gateway Demolition Corp. No Bid

Gateway Demolition Corp. No Bid United Industries and Construction Corp. No Bid

Vendor Total Batch Price
A. Russo Wrecking Inc. $967,545.00
Gateway Demolition Corp. $1,187,068.00
Gramercy Group Inc. $1,212,700.00
Advanced Site Contractors Inc. $1,505,500.00
NorthStar Contracting Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

SCE Environmental Group Vendor did not bid on all items in this batch 

The LandTek Group No Bid

Unitech Servicing Group No Bid

United Industries and Construction Corp. No Bid

Watral Brothers Inc. No Bid

Batch 1 Batch 2

Batch 3 Batch 4

Batch 5
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	Total Batch Ranking

